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Pure Dynamite is a blow by blow account of the career of Tom Billington, who wrestled solo as The
Dynamite Kid, and with Davey Boy Smith as half of the British Bulldogs tag team. Twice world champion,
Billington was featured in the pages of Playboy magazine and was an international celebrity. Although he
should have been a millionaire when he retired in 1993, after 16 years of professional wrestling, he had little
but memories are scar tissue to show for it.

As one of the first bona fide superstars in the World Wrestling Federation, Billington's career parallels the
development of the WWF, from the early days to the decade following the first Wrestlemaina event at
Madison Square Gardens in 1985. He worked with every major promoter, and wrestled with some of the
biggest names in the sport. His story is a candid expose of the highs and lows of a cultural phenomenon that
is still growing today.

Now confined to a wheelchair as a result of serious damage to his back and legs, his years of steroid use have
also damages Billington's heart and personal life. Pure Dynamite is as much a cautionary tale as it is a
glimpse into the world of a wrestling legend.
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From reader reviews:

Teressa Fernandez:

The publication untitled Pure Dynamite: The Price You Pay for Wrestling Stardom is the reserve that
recommended to you to read. You can see the quality of the publication content that will be shown to you
actually. The language that article author use to explained their way of doing something is easily to
understand. The author was did a lot of study when write the book, so the information that they share for you
is absolutely accurate. You also can get the e-book of Pure Dynamite: The Price You Pay for Wrestling
Stardom from the publisher to make you considerably more enjoy free time.

David Earnest:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try factor that really opposite from
that. A single activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller coaster you are
ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Pure Dynamite: The Price You Pay for Wrestling
Stardom, it is possible to enjoy both. It is very good combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind
of hangout type is it? Oh seriously its mind hangout men. What? Still don't understand it, oh come on its
identified as reading friends.

Helen Chandler:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to acquire information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information simpler to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You
will observe that now, a lot of publisher this print many kinds of book. The actual book that recommended to
your account is Pure Dynamite: The Price You Pay for Wrestling Stardom this book consist a lot of the
information with the condition of this world now. That book was represented how do the world has grown
up. The terminology styles that writer use to explain it is easy to understand. The writer made some
exploration when he makes this book. This is why this book suitable all of you.

Eva Lynch:

Don't be worry in case you are afraid that this book will certainly filled the space in your house, you can
have it in e-book way, more simple and reachable. That Pure Dynamite: The Price You Pay for Wrestling
Stardom can give you a lot of friends because by you taking a look at this one book you have issue that they
don't and make an individual more like an interesting person. This kind of book can be one of one step for
you to get success. This e-book offer you information that maybe your friend doesn't know, by knowing
more than additional make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? We need to have Pure Dynamite:
The Price You Pay for Wrestling Stardom.
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