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After World War I, diplomats and leaders at the Paris Peace Talks redrew the map of Europe, carving up
ancient empires and transforming Europe's eastern half into new nation-states. Drawing heavily on the past,
the leaders of these young countries crafted national mythologies and deployed them at home and abroad.
Domestically, myths were a tool for legitimating the new state with fractious electorates. In Great Power
capitals, they were used to curry favor and to compete with the mythologies and propaganda of other
insecure postwar states.

The new postwar state of Czechoslovakia forged a reputation as Europe's democratic outpost in the East, an
island of enlightened tolerance amid an increasingly fascist Central and Eastern Europe. In Battle for the
Castle, Andrea Orzoff traces the myth of Czechoslovakia as an ideal democracy. The architects of the myth
were two academics who had fled Austria-Hungary in the Great War's early years. Tomáas Garrigue
Masaryk, who became Czechoslovakia's first president, and Edvard Benes, its longtime foreign minister and
later president, propagated the idea of the Czechs as a tolerant, prosperous, and cosmopolitan people,
devoted to European ideals, and Czechoslovakia as a Western ally capable of containing both German
aggression and Bolshevik radicalism. Deeply distrustful of Czech political parties and Parliamentary leaders,
Benes and Masaryk created an informal political organization known as the Hrad or "Castle." This powerful
coalition of intellectuals, journalists, businessmen, religious leaders, and Great War veterans struggled with
Parliamentary leaders to set the country's political agenda and advance the myth. Abroad, the Castle wielded
the national myth to claim the attention and defense of the West against its increasingly hungry neighbors.
When Hitler occupied the country, the mythic Czechoslovakia gained power as its leaders went into wartime
exile. Once Czechoslovakia regained its independence after 1945, the Castle myth reappeared. After the
Communist coup of 1948, many Castle politicians went into exile in America, where they wrote the Castle
myth of an idealized Czechoslovakia into academic and political discourse.

Battle for the Castle demonstrates how this founding myth became enshrined in Czechoslovak and European
history. It powerfully articulates the centrality of propaganda and the mass media to interwar European
cultural diplomacy and politics, and the tense, combative atmosphere of European international relations
from the beginning of the First World War well past the end of the Second.
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From reader reviews:

Doris Anderson:

The book Battle for the Castle: The Myth of Czechoslovakia in Europe, 1914-1948 gives you the sense of
being enjoy for your spare time. You can utilize to make your capable a lot more increase. Book can to get
your best friend when you getting pressure or having big problem using your subject. If you can make
reading a book Battle for the Castle: The Myth of Czechoslovakia in Europe, 1914-1948 to get your habit,
you can get more advantages, like add your personal capable, increase your knowledge about some or all
subjects. You are able to know everything if you like open up and read a guide Battle for the Castle: The
Myth of Czechoslovakia in Europe, 1914-1948. Kinds of book are several. It means that, science e-book or
encyclopedia or other folks. So , how do you think about this e-book?

Sammy McManus:

Why? Because this Battle for the Castle: The Myth of Czechoslovakia in Europe, 1914-1948 is an
unordinary book that the inside of the e-book waiting for you to snap that but latter it will zap you with the
secret this inside. Reading this book adjacent to it was fantastic author who have write the book in such
remarkable way makes the content inside of easier to understand, entertaining means but still convey the
meaning entirely. So , it is good for you for not hesitating having this ever again or you going to regret it.
This unique book will give you a lot of positive aspects than the other book have such as help improving
your talent and your critical thinking way. So , still want to postpone having that book? If I ended up you I
will go to the reserve store hurriedly.

James Kostka:

Do you have something that you prefer such as book? The reserve lovers usually prefer to pick book like
comic, small story and the biggest one is novel. Now, why not striving Battle for the Castle: The Myth of
Czechoslovakia in Europe, 1914-1948 that give your entertainment preference will be satisfied by reading
this book. Reading addiction all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world far
better then how they react toward the world. It can't be mentioned constantly that reading behavior only for
the geeky particular person but for all of you who wants to always be success person. So , for all you who
want to start reading through as your good habit, you may pick Battle for the Castle: The Myth of
Czechoslovakia in Europe, 1914-1948 become your current starter.

Kim Gray:

You will get this Battle for the Castle: The Myth of Czechoslovakia in Europe, 1914-1948 by go to the
bookstore or Mall. Only viewing or reviewing it might to be your solve problem if you get difficulties for the
knowledge. Kinds of this guide are various. Not only by means of written or printed but in addition can you
enjoy this book through e-book. In the modern era such as now, you just looking because of your mobile
phone and searching what their problem. Right now, choose your current ways to get more information about



your e-book. It is most important to arrange yourself to make your knowledge are still upgrade. Let's try to
choose correct ways for you.
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