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This book brings together a collection of Dr Ramesh Thakur's opinion articles from newspapers around the
world: The Australian, Canberra Times, Daily Yomiuri, Globe and Mail, International Herald Tribune, Japan
Times, and The Hindu, plus one article from the UN Chronicle. The book's three topics—the Iraq war, the
war on terror, and weapons of mass destruction—are among the most critical issues of our times. "I am a
regular reader of Dr. Ramesh Thakur's writings. I have been impressed by his clear thinking and analysis of
world politics. [He] has challenged me many times to review my own thinking on important issues."
—Martti Ahtisaari, former President of the Republic of Finland and Chairman of the Crisis Management
Initiative "Ramesh Thakur has established a solid reputation for himself as an international public
intellectual. The articles assembled in this book have contributed in no small measure to that achievement....
Academics, diplomats, journalists as well as the wider public will all welcome the fact that these enduring
essays have been brought together in one book." —Lakhdar Brahimi, former Special Adviser to the United
Nations Secretary General "To have this wisdom and insight gathered in a single volume provides an
invaluable resource that should be made required reading for leaders and citizens alike." —Richard Falk,
Emeritus Professor, Princeton University
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From reader reviews:

Sandra McNulty:

The book War in Our Time: Reflections on Iraq, Terrorism and Weapons of Mass Destruction can give more
knowledge and information about everything you want. Why then must we leave a good thing like a book
War in Our Time: Reflections on Iraq, Terrorism and Weapons of Mass Destruction? Several of you have a
different opinion about guide. But one aim that book can give many data for us. It is absolutely proper. Right
now, try to closer along with your book. Knowledge or facts that you take for that, it is possible to give for
each other; it is possible to share all of these. Book War in Our Time: Reflections on Iraq, Terrorism and
Weapons of Mass Destruction has simple shape however you know: it has great and massive function for
you. You can look the enormous world by open up and read a book. So it is very wonderful.

Melissa Parra:

Reading a book can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
thus. There are a lot of reasons why people love it. First reading a e-book will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a book you will get new information mainly because book is one of a number of ways to
share the information or their idea. Second, looking at a book will make a person more imaginative. When
you reading a book especially fictional works book the author will bring that you imagine the story how the
people do it anything. Third, you may share your knowledge to others. When you read this War in Our Time:
Reflections on Iraq, Terrorism and Weapons of Mass Destruction, it is possible to tells your family, friends
as well as soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire different ones, make them reading a guide.

Stan Smith:

Beside this specific War in Our Time: Reflections on Iraq, Terrorism and Weapons of Mass Destruction in
your phone, it could give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or details. The information and the
knowledge you are going to got here is fresh from your oven so don't be worry if you feel like an old people
live in narrow village. It is good thing to have War in Our Time: Reflections on Iraq, Terrorism and
Weapons of Mass Destruction because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you
sometimes have book but you don't get what it's facts concerning. Oh come on, that wil happen if you have
this in the hand. The Enjoyable arrangement here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful
island. Use you still want to miss it? Find this book and also read it from now!

Lesley Dwyer:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information originating from a book. Book is written or printed or illustrated from each source which filled
update of news. With this modern era like today, many ways to get information are available for anyone.
From media social just like newspaper, magazines, science publication, encyclopedia, reference book, fresh
and comic. You can add your knowledge by that book. Isn't it time to spend your spare time to spread out



your book? Or just searching for the War in Our Time: Reflections on Iraq, Terrorism and Weapons of Mass
Destruction when you essential it?
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