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Made in Japan examines the artistic dialogue between East and West as it played out between 1945 and
1970. During this post-World War II period, Japanese printmakers effectively acted as ambassadors,
bringing their aesthetic traditions into fruitful interaction with contemporary American trends and forging
ties with artists, scholars, museums, and collectors. This volume presents for the first time an integrated
history of innovative visual experimentation and pioneering cultural patronage.

The creative print (sosaku hanga) movement originated in the early twentieth century, when Japanese artists
sought to modernize their practice by embracing Euro-American concepts of originality and autonomy. The
movement matured in the decades following World War II, when second- and third-generation sosaku hanga
printmakers continued to experiment in stylistic, technical, and thematic terms. From the early 1950s,
Japanese printmakers participated in a newly global art scene, achieving great success at international art
exhibitions sponsored by the American and Japanese governments.

The prints in this book range widely in treatment and medium, embracing woodcut, stencil, lithography,
etching, mezzotint, aquatint, and screenprint. Made in Japan includes essays by Alicia Volk and Helen
Nagata and biographies of the artists.
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From reader reviews:

Pamela Dudley:

Do you have favorite book? If you have, what is your favorite's book? Book is very important thing for us to
find out everything in the world. Each e-book has different aim or even goal; it means that publication has
different type. Some people feel enjoy to spend their time for you to read a book. These are reading whatever
they get because their hobby is definitely reading a book. What about the person who don't like looking at a
book? Sometime, individual feel need book after they found difficult problem or even exercise. Well,
probably you should have this Made in Japan: The Postwar Creative Print Movement.

Adrienne McGinnis:

Now a day folks who Living in the era just where everything reachable by connect with the internet and the
resources in it can be true or not demand people to be aware of each facts they get. How a lot more to be
smart in getting any information nowadays? Of course the reply is reading a book. Examining a book can
help folks out of this uncertainty Information mainly this Made in Japan: The Postwar Creative Print
Movement book since this book offers you rich info and knowledge. Of course the details in this book
hundred per-cent guarantees there is no doubt in it you know.

Randall Blake:

This book untitled Made in Japan: The Postwar Creative Print Movement to be one of several books that will
best seller in this year, that's because when you read this guide you can get a lot of benefit in it. You will
easily to buy this particular book in the book retail outlet or you can order it through online. The publisher
with this book sells the e-book too. It makes you easier to read this book, because you can read this book in
your Smart phone. So there is no reason for your requirements to past this e-book from your list.

Tony Partee:

Don't be worry for anyone who is afraid that this book may filled the space in your house, you might have it
in e-book means, more simple and reachable. This kind of Made in Japan: The Postwar Creative Print
Movement can give you a lot of good friends because by you checking out this one book you have point that
they don't and make anyone more like an interesting person. This particular book can be one of a step for you
to get success. This guide offer you information that probably your friend doesn't realize, by knowing more
than additional make you to be great individuals. So , why hesitate? Let us have Made in Japan: The Postwar
Creative Print Movement.
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