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Based on a vast database of over two hundred million words, the Oxford Pocket American Thesaurus of
Current English offers superb coverage of American English. Oxford's U.S. Dictionaries Program has takes
a state-of-the-art approach to the design of reference works, focusing on the words users most commonly
encounter. All Oxford American dictionaries use an easy-to-use respelling system to show how entries are
pronounced. It uses simple, familiar markings to represent common American English sounds. The result is
the most reliable word resource available, one that is more practical and less expensive, perfect for students
or the general reader. Its features include:

· Key entries that include antonym lists, with cross references to other main entries

· Synonym Studies that illuminate the subtle nuances of meaning among a group of closely related words

· Oxford's exclusive Writer's Toolkit, including a punctuation guide, usage notes, and much more With clear,
expert advice on grammar, usage, and pronunciation, this up-to-date thesaurus is the first place to look when
you want just the right word.
· 15,000 main entries keyed to over 350,000 synonyms

· Sample sentences or phrases for virtually every word sense
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From reader reviews:

Edith Macklin:

The book Oxford Pocket American Thesaurus of Current English (New Look for Oxford Dictionaries) can
give more knowledge and also the precise product information about everything you want. Exactly why must
we leave the good thing like a book Oxford Pocket American Thesaurus of Current English (New Look for
Oxford Dictionaries)? Wide variety you have a different opinion about publication. But one aim in which
book can give many info for us. It is absolutely right. Right now, try to closer together with your book.
Knowledge or info that you take for that, you could give for each other; you are able to share all of these.
Book Oxford Pocket American Thesaurus of Current English (New Look for Oxford Dictionaries) has
simple shape but the truth is know: it has great and big function for you. You can search the enormous world
by open up and read a guide. So it is very wonderful.

Kyle Gill:

Beside this particular Oxford Pocket American Thesaurus of Current English (New Look for Oxford
Dictionaries) in your phone, it could possibly give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or
info. The information and the knowledge you may got here is fresh through the oven so don't end up being
worry if you feel like an aged people live in narrow community. It is good thing to have Oxford Pocket
American Thesaurus of Current English (New Look for Oxford Dictionaries) because this book offers for
your requirements readable information. Do you at times have book but you don't get what it's interesting
features of. Oh come on, that won't happen if you have this with your hand. The Enjoyable option here
cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Use you still want to miss this? Find this book
and also read it from right now!

Keith Karam:

That book can make you to feel relax. This kind of book Oxford Pocket American Thesaurus of Current
English (New Look for Oxford Dictionaries) was colourful and of course has pictures on the website. As we
know that book Oxford Pocket American Thesaurus of Current English (New Look for Oxford Dictionaries)
has many kinds or type. Start from kids until youngsters. For example Naruto or Investigation company
Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on there. Therefore not at all of book tend to be make
you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and relax. Try to choose the best book to suit your needs and
try to like reading that.

Katherine Hood:

What is your hobby? Have you heard in which question when you got college students? We believe that that
concern was given by teacher to the students. Many kinds of hobby, Every person has different hobby. So
you know that little person similar to reading or as reading through become their hobby. You need to know
that reading is very important in addition to book as to be the issue. Book is important thing to include you



knowledge, except your personal teacher or lecturer. You get good news or update with regards to something
by book. Numerous books that can you decide to try be your object. One of them is Oxford Pocket American
Thesaurus of Current English (New Look for Oxford Dictionaries).
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