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Feriyal Adam was raised in a poor home but her dreams are rich. When her editor tells her she is no longer
needed in the newsroom, she finds herself cast into a cruel, wicked world. Then her cancer-stricken mother
dies and all hopes of love, home and family seem futile. She has to do whatever it takes to cling onto her
reporter’s dream. Women are being murdered and a curtain of fear falls on the community. Feriyal must do
her utmost to help. She goes against the grain and falls into the serial killer’s lair. Time is running out and
she can’t afford to miss the deadline. Not this time! Will Feriyal’s courage and spirit be strong enough to
help her escape from the killer’s clutches? And what will await her at the end of the dark, dangerous trip
back home? About the author: ZAHEERA Walker is an emerging writer. She is a dreamer, a communicator
and a determined young woman. She started her journalism career at a daily newspaper in Durban. Today
she works in Corporate Communications and lives in Johannesburg. She reads by day and weaves words by
night. In the moments in-between, she practises the ritual of living. There are days when she paints her
thoughts on canvas. When the images become blurred, she grabs her camera and snaps the beauty of life. She
observes life through words and writing her heart’s story keeps her sane. Zaheera writes every day. Deadline
is her first book. Her goal is to become a motivational speaker and to help women triumph through their
struggles. She is studying towards a Communication Science degree through UNISA.
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From reader reviews:

Elaine Bell:

The experience that you get from Deadline could be the more deep you excavating the information that hide
inside the words the more you get interested in reading it. It does not mean that this book is hard to recognise
but Deadline giving you thrill feeling of reading. The writer conveys their point in specific way that can be
understood by simply anyone who read this because the author of this publication is well-known enough.
This kind of book also makes your current vocabulary increase well. It is therefore easy to understand then
can go along with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We recommend you for having this kind
of Deadline instantly.

Frances Oberlin:

A lot of people always spent their very own free time to vacation or go to the outside with them household or
their friend. Were you aware? Many a lot of people spent that they free time just watching TV, as well as
playing video games all day long. If you wish to try to find a new activity that's look different you can read
some sort of book. It is really fun in your case. If you enjoy the book you read you can spent the entire day to
reading a reserve. The book Deadline it is quite good to read. There are a lot of people that recommended
this book. These folks were enjoying reading this book. When you did not have enough space to deliver this
book you can buy the actual e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from a smart phone. The
price is not to fund but this book offers high quality.

Rodney Bryant:

Beside this Deadline in your phone, it may give you a way to get more close to the new knowledge or
information. The information and the knowledge you will got here is fresh from your oven so don't possibly
be worry if you feel like an outdated people live in narrow commune. It is good thing to have Deadline
because this book offers to you personally readable information. Do you occasionally have book but you
seldom get what it's all about. Oh come on, that will not happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable
agreement here cannot be questionable, including treasuring beautiful island. Techniques you still want to
miss this? Find this book along with read it from right now!

Sue Eldred:

As a college student exactly feel bored to help reading. If their teacher requested them to go to the library or
make summary for some guide, they are complained. Just little students that has reading's heart or real their
hobby. They just do what the trainer want, like asked to the library. They go to there but nothing reading
seriously. Any students feel that reading through is not important, boring as well as can't see colorful
photographs on there. Yeah, it is for being complicated. Book is very important for you. As we know that on
this time, many ways to get whatever you want. Likewise word says, many ways to reach Chinese's country.
So , this Deadline can make you experience more interested to read.
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