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They were the unlikeliest of pairs—a handsome crooner and a skinny monkey, an Italian from Steubenville,
Ohio, and a Jew from Newark, N.J.. Before they teamed up, Dean Martin seemed destined for a mediocre
career as a nightclub singer, and Jerry Lewis was dressing up as Carmen Miranda and miming records on
stage. But the moment they got together, something clicked—something miraculous—and audiences saw it
at once.

Before long, they were as big as Elvis or the Beatles would be after them, creating hysteria wherever they
went and grabbing an unprecedented hold over every entertainment outlet of the era: radio, television,
movies, stage shows, and nightclubs. Martin and Lewis were a national craze, an American institution. The
millions (and the women) flowed in, seemingly without end—and then, on July 24, 1956, ten years from the
day when the two men joined forces, it all ended.

After that traumatic day, the two wouldn’t speak again for twenty years. And while both went on to forge
triumphant individual careers—Martin as a movie and television star, recording artist, and nightclub
luminary (and charter member of the Rat Pack); Lewis as the groundbreaking writer, producer, director, and
star of a series of hugely successful movie comedies—their parting left a hole in the national psyche, as well
as in each man’s heart.

In a memoir by turns moving, tragic, and hilarious, Jerry Lewis recounts with crystal clarity every step of a
fifty-year friendship, from the springtime, 1945 afternoon when the two vibrant young performers destined
to conquer the world together met on Broadway and Fifty-fourth Street, to their tragic final encounter in the
1990s, when Lewis and his wife ran into Dean Martin, a broken and haunted old man.

In Dean & Me, Jerry Lewis makes a convincing case for Dean Martin as one of the great—and most
underrated—comic talents of our era. But what comes across most powerfully in this definitive memoir is the
depth of love Lewis felt, and still feels, for his partner, and which his partner felt for him: truly a love to last
for all time.
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From reader reviews:

Pauline Stern:

The publication with title Dean and Me: (A Love Story) posesses a lot of information that you can learn it.
You can get a lot of help after read this book. That book exist new information the information that exist in
this publication represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important to yo7u to find out how
the improvement of the world. This specific book will bring you throughout new era of the
internationalization. You can read the e-book with your smart phone, so you can read the idea anywhere you
want.

Jacki Peters:

Playing with family inside a park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with pals is thing that
usually you might have done when you have spare time, in that case why you don't try matter that really
opposite from that. A single activity that make you not experiencing tired but still relaxing, trilling like on
roller coaster you are ride on and with addition of information. Even you love Dean and Me: (A Love Story),
it is possible to enjoy both. It is great combination right, you still need to miss it? What kind of hangout type
is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout guys. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come on its called reading friends.

Jodi Harper:

In this age globalization it is important to someone to receive information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to
share. You can find a lot of references to get information example: internet, newspapers, book, and soon.
You will observe that now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to you is Dean and Me: (A Love Story) this publication consist a lot of the information on the
condition of this world now. That book was represented how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles
that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. The actual writer made some research when he makes
this book. Honestly, that is why this book suitable all of you.

Wayne Kong:

This Dean and Me: (A Love Story) is brand-new way for you who has curiosity to look for some information
given it relief your hunger info. Getting deeper you upon it getting knowledge more you know or perhaps
you who still having small amount of digest in reading this Dean and Me: (A Love Story) can be the light
food to suit your needs because the information inside this book is easy to get simply by anyone. These
books produce itself in the form that is reachable by anyone, sure I mean in the e-book form. People who
think that in book form make them feel tired even dizzy this e-book is the answer. So there is no in reading a
publication especially this one. You can find actually looking for. It should be here for a person. So , don't
miss this! Just read this e-book sort for your better life in addition to knowledge.
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