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Silence, John Cage’s first book and epic masterpiece, was published in October 1961. In these lectures,
scores, and writings, Cage tries, as he says, to find a way of writing that comes from ideas, is not about them,
but that produces them. Often these writings include mesostics and essays created by subjecting the work of
other writers to chance procedures using the I Ching. Fifty years later comes a beautiful new edition with a
foreword by eminent music critic Kyle Gann. A landmark book in American arts and culture, Silence has
been translated into more than forty languages and has sold over half a million copies worldwide. Wesleyan
University Press is proud to celebrate the fiftieth anniversary of the book’s publication with this special
hardcover edition.
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From reader reviews:

Harold Martinez:

In this 21st millennium, people become competitive in every single way. By being competitive today, people
have do something to make them survives, being in the middle of typically the crowded place and notice by
surrounding. One thing that at times many people have underestimated that for a while is reading. Yes, by
reading a e-book your ability to survive raise then having chance to stand than other is high. To suit your
needs who want to start reading a book, we give you this specific Silence: Lectures and Writings, 50th
Anniversary Edition book as nice and daily reading guide. Why, because this book is greater than just a
book.

Stacy Vincent:

A lot of people always spent their particular free time to vacation as well as go to the outside with them
friends and family or their friend. Are you aware? Many a lot of people spent they free time just watching
TV, or maybe playing video games all day long. If you want to try to find a new activity honestly, that is
look different you can read the book. It is really fun for yourself. If you enjoy the book you read you can
spent all day long to reading a publication. The book Silence: Lectures and Writings, 50th Anniversary
Edition it is rather good to read. There are a lot of individuals who recommended this book. These people
were enjoying reading this book. Should you did not have enough space to deliver this book you can buy
often the e-book. You can m0ore effortlessly to read this book from a smart phone. The price is not to cover
but this book has high quality.

Cecil Hardin:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make anyone
to understand the condition of the world. The health of the world makes the information better to share. You
can find a lot of sources to get information example: internet, newspaper, book, and soon. You will see that
now, a lot of publisher that print many kinds of book. Often the book that recommended to you personally is
Silence: Lectures and Writings, 50th Anniversary Edition this guide consist a lot of the information of the
condition of this world now. This book was represented so why is the world has grown up. The terminology
styles that writer make usage of to explain it is easy to understand. The particular writer made some
investigation when he makes this book. This is why this book acceptable all of you.

Wendell Radford:

As a pupil exactly feel bored to be able to reading. If their teacher expected them to go to the library in order
to make summary for some reserve, they are complained. Just tiny students that has reading's heart or real
their passion. They just do what the teacher want, like asked to the library. They go to presently there but
nothing reading significantly. Any students feel that reading is not important, boring as well as can't see
colorful photos on there. Yeah, it is to become complicated. Book is very important for yourself. As we
know that on this period of time, many ways to get whatever we really wish for. Likewise word says, many



ways to reach Chinese's country. So , this Silence: Lectures and Writings, 50th Anniversary Edition can
make you sense more interested to read.
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