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Fidel Castro was powerless, in prison, when the Cuban Revolution was launched - by a tiny woman named
Celia Sánchez. A fearless and brilliant organizer and recruiter, she created, nurtured, and led the insurgency
that ousted the U.S.-backed dictator Fulgencio Batista, the Mafia, the Communist Party of Cuba, and the
U.S. capitalists from Cuba in 1959. Castro's first two thrusts against Batista were dismal failures - the attack
on the powerful Moncada Army Barracks on July 26, 1953, when everyone in his terribly outmanned and
outgunned little force was either killed or captured and imprisoned; and, after two years of imprisonment, his
return from Mexico on a leaky yacht in December of 1956, when 70 of his 81 rebels were quickly ambushed
and killed by a Batista army as they scrambled ashore at Playa Colorado. The twelve survivors - including
the Castro brothers Fidel and Raúl, Che Guevara, Camilo Cienfuegos, and Juan Almeida - were saved by and
joined up with Celia's already viable guerrilla movement in the foothills of the Sierra Maestra Mountains of
eastern Cuba. Only then did they begin to make a dent in the supposedly impregnable Batista arsenal. From
their first meeting in the Sierras till victory was theirs in the first week of January, 1959, Castro never forgot
whose revolution it was - Celia's. And from January of 1959 till she died of cancer in January of 1980, he
never forgot whose Cuba it was - Celia's. And it still is, as Castro has ruled the beleaguered island even since
1980 only in the manner he perceives Celia would want him to rule it. Rich Haney has studied the Cuban
Revolution for over twenty years, particularly how it relates to America. This all-consuming interest in Cuba
began innocently enough. Throughout the 1970s, he was Sports Anchor/Director of WTVR-TV, the CBS
affiliate in Richmond, Virginia. After airing an interview with the Brown Bomber, Joe Louis, he received a
telephone call from an elderly black woman named Nora Peters. As a retired free-lance journalist, she knew
Joe and he fondly remembered her. Over the next twelve years, until she died at the age of 82, Haney and
Peters established a warm friendship. Ms. Peters first met Celia Sánchez in 1953 in Batista's Cuba. The
letters Ms. Peters received from Celia between 1959 and 1979 describe Celia's life during and after the
overthrow of the U.S.-backed Batista regime, the Cuban Missile Crisis, and the continuing harassment from
Florida-based Cuban émigré groups. Haney writes from the basis of this remarkable collection of letters, plus
personal correspondence with Cuban journalist Marta Rojas and information gathered from Cuban archives
and museums and the US National Archives. He went to Cuba in March 2004, on a legal license from the
U.S. Treasury, to attempt to confirm the mystical hold Celia exercises over Fidel Castro to this day. That
confirmation was realized. Celia Sánchez was and is the heart and soul of the Cuban Revolution, and it will
be her Cuba as long as Fidel Castro is in place. Castro turned 79 on August 13, 2005, in his 46th year as
Cuba's leader. The transition to post-Castro Cuba looms vividly on the horizon, whether it comes as a result
of natural causes or with an "assist" by the Batistiano-influenced U.S. government. This highly personal
account gives insights into the U.S.-Cuban relationship and the motivations of Cuba's leaders at a historical
juncture. Rich Haney has also authored Sacajawea: Her True Story, and a Civil War novel, Chattahoochee.
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From reader reviews:

Keith Cochran:

Information is provisions for anyone to get better life, information today can get by anyone from
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even restricted. What people must be consider
whenever those information which is in the former life are difficult to be find than now's taking seriously
which one is appropriate to believe or which one typically the resource are convinced. If you find the
unstable resource then you obtain it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of
those possibilities will not happen throughout you if you take Celia Sanchez: The Legend of Cuba's
Revolutionary Heart (HC) as your daily resource information.

Keith Devine:

The e-book untitled Celia Sanchez: The Legend of Cuba's Revolutionary Heart (HC) is the guide that
recommended to you to read. You can see the quality of the e-book content that will be shown to you
actually. The language that writer use to explained their ideas are easily to understand. The article writer was
did a lot of investigation when write the book, to ensure the information that they share to you is absolutely
accurate. You also could get the e-book of Celia Sanchez: The Legend of Cuba's Revolutionary Heart (HC)
from the publisher to make you far more enjoy free time.

Helen Williams:

Spent a free time to be fun activity to do! A lot of people spent their sparetime with their family, or their very
own friends. Usually they accomplishing activity like watching television, planning to beach, or picnic inside
park. They actually doing same every week. Do you feel it? Do you need to something different to fill your
personal free time/ holiday? Can be reading a book is usually option to fill your totally free time/ holiday.
The first thing that you ask may be what kinds of reserve that you should read. If you want to test look for
book, may be the e-book untitled Celia Sanchez: The Legend of Cuba's Revolutionary Heart (HC) can be
very good book to read. May be it can be best activity to you.

James Sanchez:

People live in this new morning of lifestyle always make an effort to and must have the time or they will get
wide range of stress from both lifestyle and work. So , when we ask do people have free time, we will say
absolutely sure. People is human not only a robot. Then we consult again, what kind of activity do you
possess when the spare time coming to anyone of course your answer can unlimited right. Then do you try
this one, reading publications. It can be your alternative with spending your spare time, often the book you
have read is usually Celia Sanchez: The Legend of Cuba's Revolutionary Heart (HC).



Download and Read Online Celia Sanchez: The Legend of Cuba's
Revolutionary Heart (HC) Rich Haney #OE3SAT9GQ8L



Read Celia Sanchez: The Legend of Cuba's Revolutionary Heart
(HC) by Rich Haney for online ebook

Celia Sanchez: The Legend of Cuba's Revolutionary Heart (HC) by Rich Haney Free PDF d0wnl0ad, audio
books, books to read, good books to read, cheap books, good books, online books, books online, book
reviews epub, read books online, books to read online, online library, greatbooks to read, PDF best books to
read, top books to read Celia Sanchez: The Legend of Cuba's Revolutionary Heart (HC) by Rich Haney
books to read online.

Online Celia Sanchez: The Legend of Cuba's Revolutionary Heart (HC) by Rich Haney
ebook PDF download

Celia Sanchez: The Legend of Cuba's Revolutionary Heart (HC) by Rich Haney Doc

Celia Sanchez: The Legend of Cuba's Revolutionary Heart (HC) by Rich Haney Mobipocket

Celia Sanchez: The Legend of Cuba's Revolutionary Heart (HC) by Rich Haney EPub


