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In this second edition of The Sociology of Food and Agriculture, students are provided with a substantially
revised and updated introductory text to this emergent field.

The book begins with the recent development of agriculture under capitalism and neo-liberal regimes, and
the transformation of farming and peasant agriculture from a small-scale, family-run way of life to a
globalized system. Topics such as the global hunger and obesity challenges, GM foods, and international
trade and subsidies are assessed as part of the world food economy. The final section concentrates on themes
of sustainability, food security, and food sovereignty. The book concludes on a positive note, examining
alternative agri-food movements aimed at changing foodscapes at levels from the local to the global.

With increased coverage of the financialization of food, food and culture, gender, ethnicity and justice, food
security, and food sovereignty, the book is perfect for students with little or no background in sociology and
is also suitable for more advanced courses as a comprehensive primer. All chapters include learning
objectives, suggested discussion questions, and recommendations for further reading to aid student learning.
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From reader reviews:

Gregory Proctor:

The feeling that you get from The Sociology of Food and Agriculture (Earthscan Food and Agriculture) is a
more deep you looking the information that hide inside words the more you get considering reading it. It
does not mean that this book is hard to understand but The Sociology of Food and Agriculture (Earthscan
Food and Agriculture) giving you excitement feeling of reading. The article author conveys their point in
specific way that can be understood simply by anyone who read it because the author of this guide is well-
known enough. This kind of book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. So it is easy to
understand then can go together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for
having this kind of The Sociology of Food and Agriculture (Earthscan Food and Agriculture) instantly.

John Caldwell:

Information is provisions for individuals to get better life, information these days can get by anyone on
everywhere. The information can be a know-how or any news even an issue. What people must be consider
while those information which is in the former life are hard to be find than now's taking seriously which one
is appropriate to believe or which one the actual resource are convinced. If you have the unstable resource
then you get it as your main information there will be huge disadvantage for you. All of those possibilities
will not happen throughout you if you take The Sociology of Food and Agriculture (Earthscan Food and
Agriculture) as the daily resource information.

Kathleen Bonds:

This The Sociology of Food and Agriculture (Earthscan Food and Agriculture) is great guide for you because
the content that is certainly full of information for you who else always deal with world and possess to make
decision every minute. This particular book reveal it information accurately using great arrange word or we
can point out no rambling sentences inside it. So if you are read the item hurriedly you can have whole facts
in it. Doesn't mean it only offers you straight forward sentences but challenging core information with
beautiful delivering sentences. Having The Sociology of Food and Agriculture (Earthscan Food and
Agriculture) in your hand like obtaining the world in your arm, details in it is not ridiculous one particular.
We can say that no guide that offer you world with ten or fifteen small right but this publication already do
that. So , this can be good reading book. Hi Mr. and Mrs. stressful do you still doubt in which?

Shawn Stoltzfus:

You can spend your free time you just read this book this publication. This The Sociology of Food and
Agriculture (Earthscan Food and Agriculture) is simple to create you can read it in the park, in the beach,
train and soon. If you did not possess much space to bring the particular printed book, you can buy the actual
e-book. It is make you easier to read it. You can save the actual book in your smart phone. So there are a lot
of benefits that you will get when you buy this book.
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