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In response to the rise in chronic medical conditions--and the growing use of complementary and alternative
therapies--among pediatric and adolescent patients, healthcare practitioners are taking a serious look at
pediatric integrative medicine (PIM). Although it dovetails with current concepts of preventive medicine,
wellness, and patient control, PIM is still an evolving field with its own particular challenges and
opportunities.

A Guide to Integrative Pediatrics for the Healthcare Professional explores its subject through the more
familiar lens of integrative medicine. This concise comprehensive resource synthesizes the knowledge base
on a range of therapies commonly associated with PIM, such as acupuncture, herbal remedies, clinical
hypnosis, yoga, homeopathy, and therapeutic massage, with findings on their effective use with children.
Case examples illustrate uses of PIM modalities with allopathic medicine to treat young patients at various
developmental stages, and the authors pinpoint safety and appropriateness concerns, answer licensing
questions, and note clinical areas requiring further study. The wide-ranging information contained here will
help support interest in PIM at the research, training, and practice levels. Features of the Guide:

An introduction to basic concepts in PIM.●

Trends in IM/PIM education.●

A survey of complementary and alternative therapies, including biologically-based, body-based, mind-●

body, energy-based, and alternative whole systems.
Current evidence for IM in treating common pediatric conditions.●

The future of integrative pediatrics.●

References and links for further information.●

Offering a front-row seat to the continued expansion of the field, A Guide to Integrative Pediatrics for the
Healthcare Professional is a salient text not only for pediatricians but for all healthcare practitioners tasked
with improving children's wellbeing. <
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From reader reviews:

Edward Olivieri:

What do you concerning book? It is not important to you? Or just adding material when you need something
to explain what the one you have problem? How about your extra time? Or are you busy person? If you don't
have spare time to do others business, it is make you feel bored faster. And you have free time? What did
you do? Everyone has many questions above. They need to answer that question since just their can do that.
It said that about e-book. Book is familiar in each person. Yes, it is suitable. Because start from on jardín de
infancia until university need this A Guide to Integrative Pediatrics for the Healthcare Professional
(SpringerBriefs in Public Health) to read.

Mary Andrade:

Reading a reserve can be one of a lot of activity that everyone in the world loves. Do you like reading book
therefore. There are a lot of reasons why people like it. First reading a guide will give you a lot of new facts.
When you read a publication you will get new information simply because book is one of many ways to
share the information or perhaps their idea. Second, studying a book will make a person more imaginative.
When you looking at a book especially fictional works book the author will bring you to imagine the story
how the people do it anything. Third, you are able to share your knowledge to some others. When you read
this A Guide to Integrative Pediatrics for the Healthcare Professional (SpringerBriefs in Public Health), you
may tells your family, friends and soon about yours e-book. Your knowledge can inspire others, make them
reading a guide.

David Bolds:

You could spend your free time to read this book this publication. This A Guide to Integrative Pediatrics for
the Healthcare Professional (SpringerBriefs in Public Health) is simple to deliver you can read it in the
playground, in the beach, train and also soon. If you did not have got much space to bring often the printed
book, you can buy the actual e-book. It is make you better to read it. You can save often the book in your
smart phone. Consequently there are a lot of benefits that you will get when one buys this book.

Harvey Lee:

Beside this A Guide to Integrative Pediatrics for the Healthcare Professional (SpringerBriefs in Public
Health) in your phone, it may give you a way to get nearer to the new knowledge or info. The information
and the knowledge you might got here is fresh through the oven so don't always be worry if you feel like an
outdated people live in narrow small town. It is good thing to have A Guide to Integrative Pediatrics for the
Healthcare Professional (SpringerBriefs in Public Health) because this book offers for your requirements
readable information. Do you at times have book but you don't get what it's interesting features of. Oh come
on, that would not happen if you have this in your hand. The Enjoyable option here cannot be questionable,
similar to treasuring beautiful island. So do you still want to miss the item? Find this book and read it from
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