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New York Times & USA Today best-selling author, Judy Angelo, presents:

The Billionaire Brothers Kent, Book 3 of 4 - Ridge's story

As a research scientist it is Lani Donatelli's dream to make a difference in the lives of people suffering from
neurodegenerative diseases. There's only one problem, and it's a huge one - she's lost her funding from the
big pharmaceutical companies and her research lab is in danger of closing down. Without funding her
experiments are at a standstill. On top of that, she has one month to come up with the money to clear months
of arrears with the leasing company before she and her team are evicted. In desperation, she turns to the one
man she knows can save her skin. But is she willing to pay the price he demands?

As co-member of a Houston school board, Ridge Kent has admired Lani Donatelli for months. She, however,
can't stand him. According to her, he's nothing but a joker and an annoying one at that. Their disagreements
at board meetings don't help since the constant conflict builds a brick wall between them. He wants to get to
know her better but how can he, when all their interactions have been the polar opposite of positive? And
then, like a heaven-sent miracle, lovely little Lani falls right into his hands. She has nowhere to turn but to
him. He is willing to help, on one condition - Lani Donatelli must become his wife.

Bride by blackmail - a recipe for disaster or an unexpected chance for love?
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From reader reviews:

Jeffrey Osburn:

Inside other case, little persons like to read book Billionaire's Blackmail Bride: Ridge's Story (The
Billionaire Brothers Kent Book 3). You can choose the best book if you appreciate reading a book. Provided
that we know about how is important any book Billionaire's Blackmail Bride: Ridge's Story (The Billionaire
Brothers Kent Book 3). You can add understanding and of course you can around the world by just a book.
Absolutely right, simply because from book you can learn everything! From your country until finally
foreign or abroad you can be known. About simple thing until wonderful thing it is possible to know that. In
this era, you can open a book as well as searching by internet system. It is called e-book. You can use it
when you feel weary to go to the library. Let's examine.

Shelia Lopez:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children right up until adult are different content. As you
may know that book is very important for us. The book Billionaire's Blackmail Bride: Ridge's Story (The
Billionaire Brothers Kent Book 3) seemed to be making you to know about other know-how and of course
you can take more information. It is extremely advantages for you. The book Billionaire's Blackmail Bride:
Ridge's Story (The Billionaire Brothers Kent Book 3) is not only giving you far more new information but
also to be your friend when you really feel bored. You can spend your own spend time to read your guide.
Try to make relationship together with the book Billionaire's Blackmail Bride: Ridge's Story (The Billionaire
Brothers Kent Book 3). You never really feel lose out for everything in case you read some books.

Robert Younger:

Reserve is one of source of know-how. We can add our understanding from it. Not only for students but also
native or citizen have to have book to know the revise information of year for you to year. As we know those
textbooks have many advantages. Beside many of us add our knowledge, can also bring us to around the
world. By the book Billionaire's Blackmail Bride: Ridge's Story (The Billionaire Brothers Kent Book 3) we
can acquire more advantage. Don't one to be creative people? Being creative person must choose to read a
book. Just choose the best book that appropriate with your aim. Don't become doubt to change your life with
this book Billionaire's Blackmail Bride: Ridge's Story (The Billionaire Brothers Kent Book 3). You can more
appealing than now.

Scott Fisher:

Reading a reserve make you to get more knowledge from the jawhorse. You can take knowledge and
information coming from a book. Book is published or printed or illustrated from each source which filled
update of news. Within this modern era like now, many ways to get information are available for you. From
media social like newspaper, magazines, science guide, encyclopedia, reference book, story and comic. You
can add your knowledge by that book. Are you hip to spend your spare time to spread out your book? Or just



searching for the Billionaire's Blackmail Bride: Ridge's Story (The Billionaire Brothers Kent Book 3) when
you desired it?
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