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The law of attraction is based on the idea that everything in the universe has a "polarity", meaning that
everything - from the food you eat, to the people you talk to, to the things you say, to the things you think -
contains an either positive or negative kind of energy. Notice that being with people who complain or rant a
lot tends to make you feel bad, even though you're not exactly experiencing what they're going through -
that's the law of attraction working its magic. When you focus on negative stuff, then more negative stuff
will happen to you. On the other hand, when you focus on positive stuff, then more positive stuff will happen
to you.

Fortunately, there is a way to manipulate the law of attraction and make it work for you: by changing your
beliefs, using the power of positive affirmation. Positive affirmations give you a fresh pair of eyes to see the
world and, therefore, give you courage to achieve a lot of things you never knew were possible.

Contents:

Affirmation One - Day Dreams Music●
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Affirmation Three - Voice Only●

Bonus:
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Benefits of Positive Affirmation●

The Power of Repeated Words and Thoughts●
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From reader reviews:

Cynthia Carter:

This Fear of Flying Affirmations: Positive Daily Affirmations to Help You Overcome Flying Phobia Using
the Law of Attraction, Self-Hypnosis, Guided Meditation book is not really ordinary book, you have after
that it the world is in your hands. The benefit you will get by reading this book is definitely information
inside this reserve incredible fresh, you will get facts which is getting deeper anyone read a lot of
information you will get. This specific Fear of Flying Affirmations: Positive Daily Affirmations to Help You
Overcome Flying Phobia Using the Law of Attraction, Self-Hypnosis, Guided Meditation without we realize
teach the one who reading through it become critical in pondering and analyzing. Don't possibly be worry
Fear of Flying Affirmations: Positive Daily Affirmations to Help You Overcome Flying Phobia Using the
Law of Attraction, Self-Hypnosis, Guided Meditation can bring any time you are and not make your handbag
space or bookshelves' grow to be full because you can have it in the lovely laptop even cellphone. This Fear
of Flying Affirmations: Positive Daily Affirmations to Help You Overcome Flying Phobia Using the Law of
Attraction, Self-Hypnosis, Guided Meditation having excellent arrangement in word and also layout, so you
will not sense uninterested in reading.

Mary James:

As people who live in typically the modest era should be change about what going on or facts even
knowledge to make them keep up with the era which is always change and move ahead. Some of you maybe
can update themselves by reading books. It is a good choice for yourself but the problems coming to an
individual is you don't know what kind you should start with. This Fear of Flying Affirmations: Positive
Daily Affirmations to Help You Overcome Flying Phobia Using the Law of Attraction, Self-Hypnosis,
Guided Meditation is our recommendation to cause you to keep up with the world. Why, because book
serves what you want and need in this era.

Sharon Lopez:

The book with title Fear of Flying Affirmations: Positive Daily Affirmations to Help You Overcome Flying
Phobia Using the Law of Attraction, Self-Hypnosis, Guided Meditation posesses a lot of information that
you can learn it. You can get a lot of help after read this book. This particular book exist new understanding
the information that exist in this e-book represented the condition of the world at this point. That is important
to yo7u to understand how the improvement of the world. That book will bring you in new era of the
globalization. You can read the e-book on the smart phone, so you can read that anywhere you want.

James Martin:

Many people spending their time by playing outside along with friends, fun activity using family or just
watching TV the whole day. You can have new activity to spend your whole day by studying a book. Ugh,



you think reading a book will surely hard because you have to bring the book everywhere? It okay you can
have the e-book, getting everywhere you want in your Smart phone. Like Fear of Flying Affirmations:
Positive Daily Affirmations to Help You Overcome Flying Phobia Using the Law of Attraction, Self-
Hypnosis, Guided Meditation which is getting the e-book version. So , why not try out this book? Let's view.
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