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In Pole Raising and Speech Making, author Jennifer Eastman Attebery focuses on the beginnings of the
traditional Scandinavian Midsummer celebration and the surrounding spring-to-summer seasonal festivities
in the Rocky Mountain West during the height of Swedish immigration to the area—1880–1917.

Combining research in folkloristics and history, Attebery explores various ways that immigrants blended
traditional Swedish Midsummer-related celebrations with local civic celebrations of American Independence
Day on July 4 and the Mormons’ Pioneer Day on July 24. Functioning as multimodal observances with
multiple meanings, these holidays represent and reconsider ethnicity and panethnicity, sacred and secular
relationships, and the rural and the urban, demonstrating how flexible and complex traditional celebrations
can be.

Providing a wealth of detail and information surrounding little-studied celebrations and valuable archival and
published primary sources—diaries, letters, speeches, newspaper reports, and images—Pole Raising and
Speech Making is proof that non-English immigrant culture must be included when discussing “American”
culture. It will be of interest to scholars and graduate students in ethnic studies, folklore, ritual and festival
studies, and Scandinavian American cultural history.
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From reader reviews:

Terri Wiggins:

This Pole Raising and Speech Making: Modalities of Swedish American Summer Celebration (Ritual,
Festival, and Celebration) usually are reliable for you who want to become a successful person, why. The
explanation of this Pole Raising and Speech Making: Modalities of Swedish American Summer Celebration
(Ritual, Festival, and Celebration) can be one of several great books you must have is actually giving you
more than just simple studying food but feed anyone with information that might be will shock your prior
knowledge. This book is definitely handy, you can bring it everywhere you go and whenever your conditions
at e-book and printed people. Beside that this Pole Raising and Speech Making: Modalities of Swedish
American Summer Celebration (Ritual, Festival, and Celebration) giving you an enormous of experience
including rich vocabulary, giving you trial run of critical thinking that we realize it useful in your day task.
So , let's have it and enjoy reading.

George Hardy:

The book untitled Pole Raising and Speech Making: Modalities of Swedish American Summer Celebration
(Ritual, Festival, and Celebration) contain a lot of information on the idea. The writer explains your
girlfriend idea with easy method. The language is very clear to see all the people, so do certainly not worry,
you can easy to read the idea. The book was written by famous author. The author brings you in the new
period of literary works. You can read this book because you can keep reading your smart phone, or product,
so you can read the book throughout anywhere and anytime. In a situation you wish to purchase the e-book,
you can start their official web-site along with order it. Have a nice learn.

Jewell Garza:

In this time globalization it is important to someone to find information. The information will make a
professional understand the condition of the world. The condition of the world makes the information better
to share. You can find a lot of referrals to get information example: internet, classifieds, book, and soon. You
can observe that now, a lot of publisher which print many kinds of book. The particular book that
recommended to you personally is Pole Raising and Speech Making: Modalities of Swedish American
Summer Celebration (Ritual, Festival, and Celebration) this book consist a lot of the information from the
condition of this world now. That book was represented how can the world has grown up. The dialect styles
that writer require to explain it is easy to understand. Typically the writer made some investigation when he
makes this book. Here is why this book appropriate all of you.

Beatrice Rogers:

Reading a publication make you to get more knowledge from this. You can take knowledge and information
coming from a book. Book is prepared or printed or outlined from each source that filled update of news.
With this modern era like right now, many ways to get information are available for you actually. From



media social including newspaper, magazines, science book, encyclopedia, reference book, new and comic.
You can add your knowledge by that book. Do you want to spend your spare time to open your book? Or just
seeking the Pole Raising and Speech Making: Modalities of Swedish American Summer Celebration (Ritual,
Festival, and Celebration) when you needed it?
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