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From one of the world's leading graphic designers comes a stunning tribute to America's most enduring icon-
the Stars and Stripes.The Revolutionary Congress resolved in 1777 that "the flag of the United States be 13
stripes, alternate red and white, that the Union be 13 white stars in a blue field representing a new
constellation." Since that time, the American flag has been raised high in wartime triumph and peacetime
celebration; burned in fervent protest; sewn lovingly onto quilts, caps, pillows, and bags; appropriated by the
commercial sphere to sell goods as varied as cigars, and designer clothing, and rock-and-roll albums; and
faithfully honored every 4th of July to celebrate America's independence. This collection of more than 3,000
Stars and Stripes artifacts ranges from Civil War-era banners and Native American braided moccasins to an
early 20th-century "friendship" kimono and original flag art by several of the world's leading designers. In its
deluxe format with over 500 illustrations, LONG MAY SHE WAVE gives wide berth to the flag in all its
manifestations, and the result is a stunning visual history of America'¬?s most treasured symbol.Full-color
throughout, with over 500 illustrations in a deluxe 11 x 14-inch volume-LONG MAY SHE WAVE is the
perfect gift for folk-art appreciators, history buffs, and collectors.Features the 3,000-piece exhibit that was
displayed at the American Institute of Graphic Arts and the San Jose Museum of Art in 2000. From toy
soldiers to collectable spoons, cigar blankets to historic flags—the breadth of the collection is unrivaled.For a
list of appearances by this author, check out our Calendar of Events.
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From reader reviews:

Dorothy Waddell:

Book is to be different for each grade. Book for children until finally adult are different content. To be sure
that book is very important usually. The book Long May She Wave: 100 Stars and Stripes Collectible
Postcards ended up being making you to know about other understanding and of course you can take more
information. It is rather advantages for you. The e-book Long May She Wave: 100 Stars and Stripes
Collectible Postcards is not only giving you a lot more new information but also being your friend when you
feel bored. You can spend your current spend time to read your e-book. Try to make relationship while using
book Long May She Wave: 100 Stars and Stripes Collectible Postcards. You never really feel lose out for
everything when you read some books.

Michael Carr:

The ability that you get from Long May She Wave: 100 Stars and Stripes Collectible Postcards could be the
more deep you excavating the information that hide into the words the more you get considering reading it. It
doesn't mean that this book is hard to recognise but Long May She Wave: 100 Stars and Stripes Collectible
Postcards giving you enjoyment feeling of reading. The author conveys their point in selected way that can
be understood simply by anyone who read this because the author of this book is well-known enough. That
book also makes your personal vocabulary increase well. That makes it easy to understand then can go
together with you, both in printed or e-book style are available. We suggest you for having this Long May
She Wave: 100 Stars and Stripes Collectible Postcards instantly.

Lisa Sullivan:

Playing with family in a very park, coming to see the ocean world or hanging out with buddies is thing that
usually you could have done when you have spare time, after that why you don't try thing that really opposite
from that. One particular activity that make you not feeling tired but still relaxing, trilling like on roller
coaster you are ride on and with addition of knowledge. Even you love Long May She Wave: 100 Stars and
Stripes Collectible Postcards, you may enjoy both. It is fine combination right, you still need to miss it?
What kind of hangout type is it? Oh can happen its mind hangout folks. What? Still don't obtain it, oh come
on its referred to as reading friends.

Sharon Scott:

That book can make you to feel relax. This book Long May She Wave: 100 Stars and Stripes Collectible
Postcards was bright colored and of course has pictures on the website. As we know that book Long May
She Wave: 100 Stars and Stripes Collectible Postcards has many kinds or style. Start from kids until
teenagers. For example Naruto or Private eye Conan you can read and feel that you are the character on
there. Therefore not at all of book usually are make you bored, any it offers up you feel happy, fun and
unwind. Try to choose the best book for you and try to like reading which.
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