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The discovery of the Dead Sea Scrolls revealed a world of early Jewish writing larger than the Bible, from
multiple versions of biblical texts to "revealed" books not found in our canon. Despite this diversity, the way
we read Second Temple Jewish literature remains constrained by two anachronistic categories: a theological
one, "Bible," and a bibliographic one,"book." The Literary Imagination in Jewish Antiquity suggests ways of
thinking about how Jews understood their own literature before these categories had emerged.

In many Jewish texts, there is an awareness of a vast tradition of divine writing found in multiple locations
that is only partially revealed in available scribal collections. Ancient heroes such as David are imagined not
simply as scriptural authors, but as multidimensional characters who come to be known as great writers who
are honored as founders of growing textual traditions. Scribes recognize the divine origin of texts such as
Enoch literature and other writings revealed to ancient patriarchs, which present themselves not as derivative
of the material that we now call biblical, but prior to it. Sacred writing stretches back to the dawn of time, yet
new discoveries are always around the corner.

Using familiar sources such as the Psalms, Ben Sira, and Jubilees, Eva Mroczek tells an unfamiliar story
about sacred writing not bound in a Bible. In listening to the way ancient writers describe their own
literature-rife with their own metaphors and narratives about writing-The Literary Imagination in Jewish
Antiquity also argues for greater suppleness in our own scholarly imagination, no longer bound by modern
canonical and bibliographic assumptions.
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From reader reviews:

Joseph Southard:

Reading a reserve tends to be new life style on this era globalization. With looking at you can get a lot of
information that may give you benefit in your life. Along with book everyone in this world could share their
idea. Ebooks can also inspire a lot of people. A lot of author can inspire all their reader with their story or
even their experience. Not only the storyline that share in the ebooks. But also they write about the
knowledge about something that you need example of this. How to get the good score toefl, or how to teach
your sons or daughters, there are many kinds of book which exist now. The authors on this planet always try
to improve their skill in writing, they also doing some investigation before they write for their book. One of
them is this The Literary Imagination in Jewish Antiquity.

Timothy Bullock:

The actual book The Literary Imagination in Jewish Antiquity has a lot of knowledge on it. So when you
check out this book you can get a lot of gain. The book was written by the very famous author. Tom makes
some research previous to write this book. That book very easy to read you can get the point easily after
looking over this book.

Catherine Hudson:

Do you have something that you like such as book? The book lovers usually prefer to choose book like
comic, quick story and the biggest some may be novel. Now, why not attempting The Literary Imagination
in Jewish Antiquity that give your pleasure preference will be satisfied through reading this book. Reading
behavior all over the world can be said as the opportinity for people to know world far better then how they
react to the world. It can't be explained constantly that reading addiction only for the geeky man but for all of
you who wants to possibly be success person. So , for all of you who want to start looking at as your good
habit, you could pick The Literary Imagination in Jewish Antiquity become your current starter.

Douglas Gibson:

You are able to spend your free time to read this book this publication. This The Literary Imagination in
Jewish Antiquity is simple to create you can read it in the park, in the beach, train along with soon. If you did
not include much space to bring the printed book, you can buy the particular e-book. It is make you simpler
to read it. You can save typically the book in your smart phone. And so there are a lot of benefits that you
will get when you buy this book.
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